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Enough with the dead white men! Forget what you learned in school! Ever since Columbus—who was
probably a converted Jew—“discovered” the New World, the powerful and privileged have usurped
American history. The true story of the United States lies not with the founding fathers or robber barons, but
with the country’s most overlooked and marginalized peoples: the workers, immigrants, housewives, and
slaves who built America from the ground up and made this country what it is today.

In A Most Imperfect Union, cultural critic Ilan Stavans and award-winning cartoonist Lalo Alcaraz present a
vibrant alternative history of America, giving full voice to the country’s unsung but exceptional people.
From African royals to accused witches, from Puerto Rican radicals to Arab immigrants, Stavans and
Alcaraz use sardonic humor and irreverent illustrations to introduce some of the most fascinating characters
in American history—and to recount travesties and triumphs that mainstream accounts all too often ignore.
What emerges is a colorful group portrait of these United States, one that champions America’s progress
while also acknowledging its missteps.

Sweeping and cinematic, stretching from the nation’s prehistory to the post-9/11 era, A Most Imperfect
Union is a joyous, outrageous celebration of the complex, sometimes unruly individuals and forces that have
shaped our ever-changing land.
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From reader reviews:

Ray Chung:

The reserve untitled A Most Imperfect Union: A Contrarian History of the United States is the book that
recommended to you you just read. You can see the quality of the guide content that will be shown to
anyone. The language that writer use to explained their ideas are easily to understand. The author was did a
lot of investigation when write the book, hence the information that they share for you is absolutely accurate.
You also will get the e-book of A Most Imperfect Union: A Contrarian History of the United States from the
publisher to make you far more enjoy free time.

Donald Corbett:

Reading a book for being new life style in this season; every people loves to study a book. When you study a
book you can get a great deal of benefit. When you read books, you can improve your knowledge, since
book has a lot of information onto it. The information that you will get depend on what sorts of book that
you have read. If you would like get information about your analysis, you can read education books, but if
you act like you want to entertain yourself you can read a fiction books, this kind of us novel, comics, and
soon. The A Most Imperfect Union: A Contrarian History of the United States provide you with a new
experience in looking at a book.

Daniel Young:

A lot of reserve has printed but it takes a different approach. You can get it by world wide web on social
media. You can choose the top book for you, science, amusing, novel, or whatever by searching from it. It is
called of book A Most Imperfect Union: A Contrarian History of the United States. You can add your
knowledge by it. Without leaving behind the printed book, it could add your knowledge and make you
actually happier to read. It is most critical that, you must aware about publication. It can bring you from one
destination to other place.

Shawn Martinez:

Some people said that they feel weary when they reading a e-book. They are directly felt this when they get a
half parts of the book. You can choose the particular book A Most Imperfect Union: A Contrarian History of
the United States to make your own personal reading is interesting. Your personal skill of reading skill is
developing when you just like reading. Try to choose basic book to make you enjoy you just read it and
mingle the impression about book and examining especially. It is to be initially opinion for you to like to
open a book and go through it. Beside that the reserve A Most Imperfect Union: A Contrarian History of the
United States can to be your friend when you're feel alone and confuse in doing what must you're doing of
the time.
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